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*Awarded Vendors Highlighted*

Item FOOTBALL UNIFORMS
Est. 
Qty. Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

A-Team Vikings
1 Game Jersey                                

Brand: Game Wear                   
Style: Prodigy or "Approved 
Equal" meeting  specifications.

333 No Bid $65.00 $21,645.00 No Bid $45.00 $14,985.00 No Bid $46.95 $15,634.35
Brand/Model Offered

2 Game Pants                                
Brand: Game Wear                   
Style: Havoc or "Approved 
Equal" meeting  specifications.

333 No Bid $43.00 $14,319.00 No Bid $35.00 $11,655.00 No Bid $46.95 $15,634.35
Brand/Model Offered

B- Team Bulldogs
1 Game Jersey                                

Brand: Game Wear                   
Style: Fire or "Approved Equal" 
meeting  specifications.

333 No Bid $60.00 $19,980.00 No Bid $45.00 $14,985.00 No Bid $46.95 $15,634.35
Brand/Model Offered

GameWear Prodigy

GameWear  Prodigy

GameWear Fire

This is only a tabulation of prices submitted and is not an indication of award or responsiveness. 
PRIMARY                           

Spirit Wear                     
P(305) 885-8068                      
F(305)885-0200                                 

Hialeah, FL

SECONDARY                                   
Varsity Spirit Fashions 

P(800) 533-8022 Ext 5827                     
F(305) 397-2558                                         

Memphis, TN
GameWear                                                            
Miami, FL

One Stop Business 
Solution                    

Miami Gardens, FL

FG Athletics                                            
P(954) 483-5779               
F(305) 397-2558                        

Hialeah, FL                   
(FootBall  Uniform)

Matty's Sports                   
Miami, FL

MATJAC/FBP01

MATJAC/FBJ02

MATJAC/FBJ01FG Athletics/REAPER

FG Athletics/REAPER

FG Athletics/STEALTH
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2 Game Pants                                
Brand: Game Wear                   
Style: Dagger or "Approved 
Equal" meeting  specifications.

333 No Bid $43.00 $14,319.00 No Bid $35.00 $11,655.00 No Bid $46.95 $15,634.35
Brand/Model Offered

C-Team Ravens
1 Game Jersey                                

Brand: Game Wear                   
Style: Crush or "Approved Equal" 
meeting  specifications.

333 No Bid $47.00 $15,651.00 No Bid $45.00 $14,985.00 No Bid $46.95 $15,634.35
Brand/Model Offered

2 Game Pants                                
Brand: Game Wear                   
Style: Rush or "Approved Equal" 
meeting  specifications.

333 No Bid $38.00 $12,654.00 No Bid $35.00 $11,655.00 No Bid $46.95 $15,634.35
Brand/Model Offered

D-Team Rams
1 Game Jersey                                

Brand: Game Wear                   
Style: Cyclone or "Approved 
Equal" meeting  specifications.

333 No Bid $65.00 $21,645.00 No Bid $45.00 $14,985.00 No Bid $46.95 $15,634.35
Brand/Model Offered

2 Game Pants                                
Brand: Game Wear                   
Style: Lighting or "Approved 
Equal" meeting  specifications.

333 No Bid $43.00 $14,319.00 No Bid $35.00 $11,655.00 No Bid $46.95 $15,634.35
Brand/Model Offered MATJAC/FBP04

GameWear Dagger FG Athletics/STEALTH

GameWear Cyclone

GameWear Rush FG Athletics/RAVENS

GameWear Lighting

FG Athletics/WILDCATS

FG Athletics/WILDCATS

MATJAC/FBP02

MATJAC/FBJ03

MATJAC/FBP03

MATJAC/FBJ04

FG Athletics/RAVENSGameWear Crush



E-Team Cowboys

1 Game Jersey                                
Brand: Game Wear                   
Style: Warrior or "Approved 
Equal" meeting  specifications.

333 No Bid $51.00 $16,983.00 No Bid $45.00 $14,985.00 No Bid $46.95 $15,634.35
Brand/Model Offered

2 Game Pants                                
Brand: Game Wear                   
Style: Galaxy or "Approved 
Equal" meeting  specifications.

333 No Bid $43.00 $14,319.00 No Bid $35.00 $11,655.00 No Bid $46.95 $15,634.35
Brand/Model Offered

F-Football Practice Gear
1 Practice Shorts                      

Available in all team colors, 
Youth & Adult sizes: XXS-XXXL  
Brand: GTM Sports Wear Youth 
Style: YSH800 or "Approved 
Equal" meeting specifications. 1700 No Bid No Bid $5.25 $8,925.00 $7.00 $11,900.00 No Bid $4.75 $8,075.00

Brand/Model Offered

2 Practice Pants                            
Youth & Adult sizes: XXS-XXXL  
Brand: Alleson Athletic or 
"Approved Equal" meeting 
specifications.            1700 No Bid No Bid $16.00 $27,200.00 $9.00 $15,300.00 No Bid $8.35 $14,195.00

Brand/Model Offered

3 Practice Jerseys                            
Available in all team colors, 
Youth & Adult Sizes: XXS-XXXL      
Brand: Alleson Athletic or 
"Approved Equal" meeting 
specifications. 1700 No Bid No Bid $15.00 $25,500.00 $11.00 $18,700.00 No Bid $5.90 $10,030.00

Brand/Model Offered

TOTAL FOOTBALL UNIFORMS NO BID $165,834.00 $52,838.00 $179,100.00 NO BID $188,643.50

MATJAC/FBJ05

MATJAC/FBP05

Universal Athletic/416-2

Universal Athletic/FBSPC

Varsity Spirit Fashions GameWear
One Stop Business 

Solution FG Athletics Spirit Wear Matty's Sports

Force 2000 YM

Champo/FY & FPA FG Athletics/FP100

FG Athletics/FP100

FG Athletics/SUB-0GameWear Warrior

FG Athletics/SUB-0GameWear Galaxy



CHEERLEADING UNIFORMS

A-Team Vikings
Est. 
Qty. Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

1 Cheerleading Women's Shell 
Top    Available in team colors, 
Available in Youth and adult 
sizes: XS-XXXL Varsity WS063A 
or "Approved Equal" meeting 
specifications. 225 $61.20 $13,770.00 No Bid No Bid $40.00 $9,000.00 $46.97 $10,568.25 No Bid

Brand/Model Offered

2 Cheerleading Women's 
Bodyliner  Available in team 
colors, Available in Youth and 
adult sizes: XS-XXXL Varsity 
MFBLR054W or "Approved 
Equal" meeting specifications.

225 $50.11 $11,274.75 No Bid No Bid $17.00 $3,825.00 $24.72 $5,562.00 No Bid
Brand/Model Offered

3 Cheerleading Women's A-Line 
Skirt                                                     
Available in team colors, 
Available in Youth and adult 
sizes: XS-XXXL Varsity WS063A 
or "Approved Equal" meeting 
specifications. 225 34.42 7,744.50 No Bid No Bid $30.00 $6,750.00 $32.97 $7,418.25 No Bid

Brand/Model Offered

4 Cheerleading Flyer Skirt               
Available in team colors, 
Available in Youth and adult 
sizes: XS-XXXL Varsity S1289 or 
"Approved Equal" meeting 
specifications. 18 55.68 1,002.24 No Bid No Bid $30.00 $540.00 $45.62 $821.16 No Bid

Brand/Model Offered

Matty's Sports

Spirit Wear/ 145BA

Spirit Wear 2 color arms

Spirit Wear/350B

Spirit Wear/ 312

Spirit Wear

FG Athletics/CA100

FG Athletics/CFS06

Varsity/CDT #MFLR054W

Varsity Spirit Fashions GameWear
One Stop Business 

Solution

Varsity/CDT

Adult WS063A/Youth CYW52706

Adult 50947/Youth YS0947

Adult S1298/Youth YS1298

FG Athletics/BL100

FG Athletics

Varsity/CDT FG Athletics/C530

Varsity/CDT



B-Team Bulldogs
1 Cheerleading Women's Shell 

Top Available in team colors, 
Available in Youth and adult 
sizes: XS-XXXL Varsity WS100A 
or "Approved Equal" meeting 
specifications. 225 $64.38 $14,485.50 No Bid No Bid $40.00 $9,000.00 $36.97 $8,318.25 No Bid

Brand/Model Offered

2 Cheerleading Women's 
Bodyliner     Available in team 
colors, Available in Youth and 
adult sizes: XS-XXXL Varsity 
MFBLR022W or "Approved 
Equal" meeting specifications.

225 $46.71 $10,509.75 No Bid No Bid $17.00 $3,825.00 $24.72 $5,562.00 No Bid
Brand/Model Offered

3 Cheerleading Women's A-Line 
Skirt                     Available in 
Youth and adult sizes: XS-XXXL 
Varsity S406 or "Approved 
Equal" meeting specifications.

225 $34.42 $7,744.50 No Bid No Bid $17.00 $3,825.00 $30.22 $6,799.50 No Bid
Brand/Model Offered

4 Cheerleading Flyer Skirt               
Available in Youth and adult 
sizes: XS-XXXL Varsity S1398 or 
"Approved Equal" meeting 
specifications. 18 $55.68 $1,002.24 No Bid No Bid $30.00 $540.00 $45.62 $821.16 No Bid

Brand/Model Offered

Varsity Spirit Fashions GameWear
One Stop Business 

Solution FG Athletics Spirit Wear Matty's Sports

Spirit Wear/110A

Spirit Wear 2 color arms

Spirit Wear/370

Spirit Wear/312

Adult S1398/Youth YS1398

Adult WS100A/Youth YSW100A

Varsity/CDT

Adult S406/Youth YS406

Varsity/CDT

Varsity/CDT MFBLR022W FG Athletics/BL 100

FG Athletics/C530

FG Athletics/CA100

Varsity/CDT FG Athletics/CFS06



CHEERLEADING UNIFORMS 
cont.

C-Team Ravens
Est. 
Qty. Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Extended 
Price

1 Cheerleading Women's Shell 
Top  Available in team colors, 
Available in Youth and adult 
sizes: XS-XXXL Varsity WS074R 
or "Approved Equal" meeting 
specifications. 225 $66.50 $14,962.50 No Bid No Bid $40.00 $9,000.00 $49.72 $11,187.00 No Bid

Brand/Model Offered

2 Cheerleading Women's 
Bodyliner    Available in team 
colors, Available in Youth and 
adult sizes: XS-XXXL Varsity 
MFBLR030W or "Approved 
Equal" meeting specifications.

225 $50.96 $11,466.00 No Bid No Bid $17.00 $3,825.00 $20.22 $4,549.50 No Bid
Brand/Model Offered

3 Cheerleading Women's A-Line 
Skirt                                       
Available in team colors, 
Available in Youth and adult 
sizes: XS-XXXL Varsity S025 or 
"Approved Equal" meeting 
specifications. 225 $42.91 $9,654.75 No Bid No Bid $30.00 $6,750.00 $32.97 $7,418.25 No Bid

Brand/Model Offered

Spirit Wear/ 139B

Spirit solid alterning arm

Spirit Wear/355D

Spirit Wear Matty's Sports

Adult WS074RA/Youth YWS074RA

Adult S061/Youth CYSK22008V

Varsity Spirit Fashions GameWear
One Stop Business 

Solution FG Athletics

Varsity/CDT FG Athletics/C530

Varsity/CDT MFBLR074CV FG Athletics/BL 100

Varsity/CDT FG Athletics/CA100



4 Cheerleading Flyer Skirt              
Available in team colors, 
Available in Youth and adult 
sizes: XS-XXXL Varsity S23897 or 
"Approved Equal" meeting 
specifications. 18 $74.36 $1,338.48 No Bid No Bid $30.00 $540.00 $47.82 $860.76 No Bid

Brand/Model Offered

D-Team Rams
1 Cheerleading Women's Shell 

Top  Available in team colors, 
Available in Youth and adult 
sizes: XS-XXXL Varsity WS083A 
or "Approved Equal" meeting 
specifications. 225 $60.97 $13,718.25 No Bid No Bid $40.00 $9,000.00 $49.72 $11,187.00 No Bid

Brand/Model Offered

2 Cheerleading Women's 
Bodyliner  Available in team 
colors, Available in Youth and 
adult sizes: XS-XXXL Varsity 
MFBLR083M or "Approved 
Equal" meeting specifications.

225 $56.91 $12,804.75 No Bid No Bid $17.00 $3,825.00 $35.72 $8,037.00 No Bid
Brand/Model Offered

3 Cheerleading Women's A-Line 
Skirt                                                
Available in team colors, 
Available in Youth and adult 
sizes: XS-XXXL Varsity S083 or 
"Approved Equal" meeting 
specifications. 225 $42.91 $9,654.75 No Bid No Bid $30.00 $6,750.00 $30.22 $6,799.50 No Bid

Brand/Model Offered

Spirit Wear/312A

Spirit Wear/ 149A

Spirit 4 color arm

Spirit/ 303FG Athletics/CA 100

Adult S23897/Youth YS23897

Adult WS083A/Youth YWS083A

Varsity/CDT

Adult S083/Youth YS083

Varsity/CDT FG Athletics/CFS06

Varsity/CDT FG Athletics/C530

Varsity/CDT MFBL083M FG Athletics/BL 100



4 Cheerleading Flyer Skirt              
Available in team colors, 
Available in Youth and adult 
sizes: XS-XXXL Varsity S1398 or 
"Approved Equal" meeting 
specifications. 18 $64.16 $1,154.88 No Bid No Bid $30.00 $540.00 $45.62 $821.16 No Bid

Brand/Model Offered

E-Team Cowboys
1 Cheerleading Women's Shell 

Top Available in team colors, 
Available in Youth and adult 
sizes: XS-XXXL Varsity WS0924A 
or "Approved Equal" meeting 
specifications. 225 $65.44 $14,724.00 No Bid $40.00 $9,000.00 $45.32 $10,197.00 No Bid

Brand/Model Offered

2 Cheerleading Women's 
Bodyliner   Available in team 
colors, Available in Youth and 
adult sizes: XS-XXXL Varsity 
MFBL0924WM or "Approved 
Equal" meeting specifications.

225 $47.56 $10,701.00 No Bid No Bid $17.00 $3,825.00 $30.22 $6,799.50 No Bid
Brand/Model Offered

3 Cheerleading Women's A-Line 
Skirt                                              
Available in team colors, 
Available in Youth and adult 
sizes: XS-XXXL Varsity S073 or 
"Approved Equal" meeting 
specifications. 225 $38.66 $8,698.50 No Bid No Bid $30.00 $6,750.00 $30.22 $6,799.50 No Bid

Brand/Model Offered

Spirit

Spirit/3 color arm

Spirit Wear/348A

Spirit/312

FG Athletics/C530

Adult S1398/Youth YS1398

Varsity/CDT

FG Athletics/CA100

Adult WS0924A/Youth YWS0924A

Adult S073/Youth YS073

FG Athletics/BL 100varsity/CDT MFBL0924WM

Varsity/CDT

FG Athletics/CFS06Varsity/CDT



4 Cheerleading Flyer Skirt              
Available in team colors, 
Available in Youth and adult 
sizes: XS-XXXL Varsity S1398 or 
"Approved Equal" meeting 
specifications. 18 $59.91 $1,078.38 No Bid No Bid $30.00 $540.00 $45.62 $821.16 No Bid

Brand/Model Offered

F-CHEERLEADING 
PRACTICE UNIFORMS

1 Cheerleading Women's Practice 
Shorts                                             
Available in Youth and adult 
sizes: XS-XXL & Adult sizes; XL-
XXL, Varsity SH03 or "Approved 
Equal" meeting specifications.

1125 $7.50 $8,437.50 No Bid $5.75 $6,468.75 $6.50 $7,312.50 $5.48 $6,165.00 No Bid
Brand/Model Offered

2 Cheerleading Game Briefs                                
Available in team colors, 
Available in Youth and adult 
sizes: XS-XXXL Varsity 
MFB/MFBY or "Approved Equal" 
meeting specifications.

1125 $15.25 $17,156.25 No Bid $10.75 $12,093.75 $8.00 $9,000.00 $9.87 $11,103.75 No Bid
Brand/Model Offered

TOTAL CHEERLEADING 
UNIFORMS $203,083.47 NO BID $18,562.50 $113,962.50 $138,616.65 NO BID

15% 10% 0% 1% 0% 0%

Spirit Wear/312

Soffee/ SF037

Spirit Wear/1103

Adult MFB/Youth MFBY

Varsity/CDT Pizzazz 1100 FG Athletics CBR

Adult SH03/Youth SH03Y

Varsity/CDT FG Athletics/CFS06

Varsity/CDT August 987 FG Athletics CFS100

Adult S1398/Youth YS1398

% Discount  if Awarded all items:

Varsity Spirit Fashions GameWear
One Stop Business 

Solution FG Athletics Spirit Wear Matty's Sports
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