AWARD SHEET

Title: City Wide Catering Services
Contract: [TB #09-10-062

Term: Two Years with City Option to renew for an additional two years, on a year to year basis; on an
as needed basis.

Effective 06/25/10 through 06/24/12

User Departments
City Wide

VYendor Contact Information

Name: Adams Catering, Inc. Name: Carnival Meals, Inc.
Address: 14080 NW 22™ Ave. Address: 1847 N.W. 22" Street
Miami, FL 33054 Miami, FL 33142
FID: 04-3647552 FID: 51-0605067
Phone: 305-335-8398 Phone: 305-325-9991
Emergency: 305-685-5500 Emergency: 786-317-3353
Fax: 305-625-0642 Fax: 305-325-9947
Contact: Jane Adams Contact: Aymee Bermejo de Lamar
E-mail: adams19@bellsouth.net E-mail: aymee(@carnivalmeals.net
Name: ILS Group, LLC d/b/a Classic Caterers
Address: 5201 Blue Lagoon Drive, Ste. 270
Miami, FL 33126
FID: 80-0348737
Phone: 305-262-1292
Emergency: 786-554-4329
Fax: 305-262-9322
Contact: Celia Nuno
E-mail: chunof{eilshealth.com
Name: Mama Jennie’s d/b/a Exceptional Caterers
Address: 11720 N.E. 2™ Avenue
Miami, FL 33161
¥I1D: 65-0165743
Phone: 305-756-7499
Emergency: 786-229-8638
Fax: 305-757-0712
Contact: Jennifer Berriel
E-mail: berrieljeffiner@comeast.net




City of Miami Gardens

1515 N.W. 167th Street
Miami Gardens, FL 33169

Procurement Department

Tabulation Sheet

ITB#09-10-062 CITY WIDE CATERING SERVICES
June 17, 2010 @ 2:00 p.m.

This is only a tabulation of prices submitted and is not an indicatin of award or responsiveness.

Mama Jennie's Italian

ILS Group, LLC d/b/a Restaurant d/b/a
Adams Catering, Inc. Classic Caterers Carnival Meals, Inc. Exceptional Caterers
Description Opalocka, FL Miami, FL Miami, FL Miami, FL
$per person $per person $per person $per person
BREAKFAST
Typical Continental
Breakfast
3-15 guests $12.00|no bid $1.50 $5.25
16-50 guests $12.00(no bid $1.50 $5.25
51-120 guests $10.00 $6.50 $1.50 $5.25
121-300 guests $10.00 $6.25 $1.50 $4.75
301+guests $8.00 $5.95 $1.50 $4.50
Typical Hot Buffet
Breakfast
3-15 guests $12.00(no bid $1.75 $8.25
16-50 guests $12.00|no bid $1.75 $7.75
51-120 guests $12.00 $12.50 $1.75 $7.50
121-300 guests $10.00 $11.95 $1.75 $6.75
301+guests $8.00 $10.50 $1.75 $6.50
Premium Buffet
Breakfast
3-15 guests $12.00|no bid $2.00 $9.75
16-50 guests $12.00(no bid $2.00 $9.75
51-120 guests $12.00 $13.75 $2.00 $9.75
121-300 guests $10.00 $13.25 $2.00 $9.50
301+guests $8.00 $12.75 $2.00 $9.25
Option: Omelet
3-15 guests $12.00|no bid $2.25 $4.75
16-50 guests $12.00(no bid $2.25 $4.75
51-120 guests $12.00 $8.95 $2.25 $4.75
121-300 guests $10.00 $8.50 $2.25 $4.75
301+guests $8.00 $8.25 $2.25 $4.50
LUNCH
Typical Sandwich Lunch
3-15 guests $12.00|no bid $3.00 $8.75




Mama Jennie's Italian

ILS Group, LLC d/b/a Restaurant d/b/a
Adams Catering, Inc. Classic Caterers Carnival Meals, Inc. Exceptional Caterers
Description Opalocka, FL Miami, FL Miami, FL Miami, FL
16-50 guests $12.00(no bid $3.00 $8.75
51-120 guests $10.00 $12.45 $3.00 $8.50
121-300 guests $8.00 $10.45 $3.00 $8.25
301+guests $8.00 $9.45 $3.00 $8.25
Option: Vegeterian
Lunch
3-15 guests $14.00|no bid $3.15 $9.25
16-50 guests $14.00|no bid $3.15 $9.25
51-120 guests $12.00(no bid $3.15 $8.75
121-300 guests $10.00|no bid $3.15 $8.75
301+guests $10.00(no bid $3.15 $8.50
Typical Hot Buffet Lunch
3-15 guests $14.00(no bid $3.75 $15.95
16-50 guests $14.00|no bid $3.75 $15.95
51-120 guests $12.00 $12.95 $3.75 $15.95
121-300 guests $10.00 $10.95 $3.75 $15.25
301+guests $10.00 $9.95 $3.75 $15.00
Option: One Entrée
3-15 guests $14.00|no bid $3.65 $12.95
16-50 guests $14.00|no bid $3.65 $12.95
51-120 guests $12.00 $12.95 $3.65 $12.95
121-300 guests $10.00 $10.95 $3.65 $12.25
301+guests $10.00 $9.95 $3.65 $12.00
Soup & Salad Lunch
3-15 guests $14.00(no bid $3.50 $8.75
16-50 guests $12.00|no bid $3.50 $8.75
51-120 guests $12.00 $4.95 $3.50 $8.75
121-300 guests $10.00 $4.75 $3.50 $8.25
301+guests $10.00 $4.50 $3.50 $8.25
DINNER
Typical Hot Buffet Dinner
3-15 guests $14.00(no bid $5.50 $18.95
16-50 guests $14.00(no bid $5.50 $18.95
51-120 guests $14.00 $15.95 $5.50 $18.95
121-300 guests $12.00 $14.95 $5.50 $17.25
301+guests $12.00 $12.95 $5.50 $17.25
Option: One Entrée
3-15 guests $14.00|no bid $5.35 $14.95
16-50 guests $14.00|no bid $5.35 $14.95
51-120 guests $12.00 $14.95 $5.35 $14.95
121-300 guests $12.00 $13.95 $5.35 $14.25




Mama Jennie's Italian

ILS Group, LLC d/b/a Restaurant d/b/a
Adams Catering, Inc. Classic Caterers Carnival Meals, Inc. Exceptional Caterers
Description Opalocka, FL Miami, FL Miami, FL Miami, FL
301+guests $12.00 $11.95 $5.35 $14.20
BBQ EVENTS
Hamburgers
3-15 guests $14.00|no bid $4.75 $8.50
16-50 guests $14.00(no bid $4.75 $8.50
51-120 guests $8.00 $12.70 $4.75 $8.50
121-300 guests $8.00 $12.35 $4.75 $8.50
301+guests $8.00 $11.50 $4.75 $8.25
Cheeseburgers
3-15 guests $14.00|no bid $4.25 $3.50
16-50 guests $14.00|no bid $4.25 $3.50
51-120 guests $8.00 $12.70 $4.25 $3.25
121-300 guests $8.00 $12.35 $4.25 $3.00
301+guests $8.00 $11.50 $4.25 $3.00
Turkey Burgers
3-15 guests $14.00|no bid $4.25 $3.50
16-50 guests $14.00(no bid $4.25 $3.50
51-120 guests $10.00 $12.70 $4.25 $3.25
121-300 guests $10.00 $12.35 $4.25 $3.00
301+guests $8.00 $11.50 $4.25 $3.00
BBQ Ribs
3-15 guests $14.00|no bid $4.50 $9.75
16-50 guests $14.00(no bid $4.50 $9.75
51-120 guests $10.00 $14.95 $4.50 $9.75
121-300 guests $10.00 $14.45 $4.50 $9.50
301+guests $8.00 $13.95 $4.50 $9.25
Frankfurters
3-15 guests $10.00|no bid $4.00 $7.50
16-50 guests $10.00|no bid $4.00 $7.50
51-120 guests $8.00 $8.95 $4.00 $7.50
121-300 guests $8.00 $7.95 $4.00 $7.50
301+guests $8.00 $§7.25 $4.00 $7.25
BBQ Chicken
3-15 guests $12.00|no bid $4.50 $8.50
16-50 guests $12.00(no bid $4.50 $8.50
51-120 guests $10.00 $12.95 $4.50 $8.50
121-300 guests $10.00 $12.45 $4.50 $8.50
301+guests $10.00 $11.95 $4.50 $8.25
Option:
Chef Hourly Rate $20.75|no bid $15.00 $30.00
Server Hourly Rate $17.50|no bid $8.00 $20.00

STATIONS

Carving Stations




Adams Catering, Inc.

ILS Group, LLC d/b/a
Classic Caterers

Carnival Meals, Inc.

Mama Jennie's Italian
Restaurant d/b/a
Exceptional Caterers

Description Opalocka, FL Miami, FL Miami, FL Miami, FL
3-15 guests $16.00(no bid $4.50 $17.75
16-50 guests $16.00|no bid $4.50 $17.75
51-120 guests $14.00|no bid $4.50 $17.75
121-300 guests $14.00(no bid $4.50 $17.25
301+guests $12.00|no bid $4.50 $17.25
Italian Station
3-15 guests $12.00(no bid $5.00 $16.95
16-50 guests $12.00(no bid $5.00 $15.95
51-120 guests $12.00|no bid $5.00 $15.95
121-300 guests $10.00|no bid $5.00 $14.95
301+guests $10.00|no bid $5.00 $12.95
Asian Station
3-15 guests $12.00(no bid $5.00 $13.95
16-50 guests $12.00(no bid $5.00 $13.95
51-120 guests $12.00(no bid $5.00 $13.95
121-300 guests $10.00|no bid $5.00 $12.95
301+guests $10.00|no bid $5.00 $11.95
Mexican Station
3-15 guests $12.00(no bid $5.00 $12.95
16-50 guests $12.00(no bid $5.00 $12.95
51-120 guests $12.00(no bid $5.00 $11.95
121-300 guests $10.00(no bid $5.00 $11.95
301+guests $10.00|no bid $5.00 $10.95
Option:
Chef Hourly Rate $17.50|no bid $15.00 $30.00
Server Hourly Rate $17.50|no bid $8.00 $20.00
PLATTERS
Fresh Fruit Platter
Serves 10 guests $25.00|no bid $1.50 $38.95
Serves 25 guests $65.00 $39.95 $1.50 $75.95
Serves 50 guests $80.00 $55.95 $1.50 $115.95
Cheese Platter
Serves 10 guests $25.00|no bid $1.50 $44.95
Serves 25 guests $65.00 $39.95 $1.50 $82.95
Serves 50 guests $80.00 $55.95 $1.50 $131.95
Vegetables & Dip Platter
Serves 10 guests $25.00|no bid $1.25 $38.95
Serves 25 guests $50.00 $35.95 $1.25 $75.95
Serves 50 guests $80.00 $54.95 $1.25 $115.95
Turkey Platter
Serves 10 guests $35.00|no bid $1.50 $49.95
Serves 25 guests $65.00 $36.95 $1.50 $123.75




Mama Jennie's Italian

ILS Group, LLC d/b/a Restaurant d/b/a
Adams Catering, Inc. Classic Caterers Carnival Meals, Inc. Exceptional Caterers
Description Opalocka, FL Miami, FL Miami, FL Miami, FL
Serves 50 guests $95.00 $55.95 $1.50 $247.50
Wrap Platter
Serves 10 guests $40.00|no bid $1.75 $49.95
Serves 25 guests $60.00 $36.95 $1.75 $123.75
Serves 50 guests $80.00 $55.95 $1.75 $247.50
Appetizers & hors
d'oeuvres Platter
Serves 50 guests $10.00|no bid $1.50 $2.75
Serves 51-120 guests $10.00|no bid $1.50 $2.75
Serves 121-300 guest $10.00|no bid $1.50 $2.50
Serves 301+ guest $8.00(no bid $1.50 $2.00
Dessert Platter
Serves 50 guests $8.00(no bid $1.00 $2.25
Serves 51-120 guests $8.00|no bid $1.00 $2.25
Serves 121-300 guest $7.00(no bid $1.00 $2.00
Serves 301+ guest $7.00|no bid $1.00 $1.75
PIZZA
Cheese
Slice $1.50|no bid $1.00 $1.00
Medium $8.00|no bid $7.00 $8.00
Large $10.00|no bid $10.00 $9.00
Pepperoni
Slice $1.50|no bid $1.25 $1.00
Medium $8.00|no bid $7.50 $8.00
Large $10.00|no bid $11.00 $9.00
Vegetarian
Slice $2.00|no bid $1.25 $2.00
Medium $10.00|no bid $7.50 $10.00
Large $10.00|no bid $11.00 $12.00
Drink Options
1-19 2-liter soda bottles $10.00 $1.95 $1.60 $3.00
20-40 2-liter soda bottles $20.00 $1.95 S1.60 $2.50
41-80 2-liter soda bottles $25.00 $1.95 $1.60 $2.50
EMERGENCY CATERING
BREAKFAST
#1 Breakfast:
1-500 meals $10.00 $6.95 $5.00 $7.50
501-750 meals $8.00 $6.95 $5.00 $6.50
#2 Breakfast:
1-500 meals $10.00 $6.95 $5.00 $7.50
501-750 meals $8.00 $6.95 $5.00 $6.50
#3 Breakfast:
1-500 meals $10.00 $6.95 $5.00 $7.50




Mama Jennie's Italian

ILS Group, LLC d/b/a Restaurant d/b/a
Adams Catering, Inc. Classic Caterers Carnival Meals, Inc. Exceptional Caterers
Description Opalocka, FL Miami, FL Miami, FL Miami, FL
501-750 meals $8.00 $6.95 $5.00 $6.50
LUNCH
#1 Lunch:
1-500 meals $10.00 $9.95 $5.25 $9.50
501-750 meals $10.00 $9.95 $5.25 $8.50
#2 Lunch:
1-500 meals $10.00 $9.95 $5.25 $9.50
501-750 meals $10.00 $9.95 $5.25 $8.50
#3 Lunch:
1-500 meals $10.00 $9.95 $5.25 $9.50
501-750 meals $10.00 $9.95 $5.25 $8.50
DINNER
#1 Dinner:
1-500 meals $12.00 $14.95 $5.50 $10.50
501-750 meals $12.00 $14.95 $5.50 $9.50
#2 Dinner:
1-500 meals $12.00 $14.95 $5.50 $10.50
501-750 meals $12.00 $14.95 $5.50 $9.50
#3 Dinner:
1-500 meals $14.00 $14.95 $5.50 $10.50
501-750 meals $14.00 $14.95 $5.50 $9.50
[TABLES & CHAIRS
OPTIONS
Tables
4'x30" rectangular|no bid $8.00 $8.00
6'x30" rectangular $7.00(no bid $9.00 $10.00
8'x30" rectangular $7.00|no bid $10.00 $12.00
36" card table $5.00(no bid $10.00 $8.00
3' round|no bid no bid $8.00 $8.00
4' round|no bid no bid $9.00 $8.00
5' round|no bid no bid $10.00 $8.00
6' round|no bid no bid $12.00 $10.00
30" cocktail|no bid no bid $12.00 $12.00
Table Linens
4'x30" rectangular $9.00(no bid $8.00 $10.00
6'x30" rectangular $9.00|no bid $9.00 $10.00
8'x30" rectangular $9.00(no bid $10.00 $10.00
3' round $10.00|no bid $8.00 $10.00
4' round $10.00|no bid $8.00 $10.00
5' round $10.00|no bid $8.00 $12.00
6' round $10.00|no bid $10.00 $15.00




Mama Jennie's Italian

ILS Group, LLC d/b/a Restaurant d/b/a
Adams Catering, Inc. Classic Caterers Carnival Meals, Inc. Exceptional Caterers

Description Opalocka, FL Miami, FL Miami, FL Miami, FL

30" cocktail $10.00|no bid $12.00 $15.00
Chairs

Folding Chairs $1.00(no bid $1.00 $2.00
Stacking Chairs $1.00|no bid $1.00 $3.75
Set-up & Break down $150.00(no bid $30.00 $125.00
Delivery & Pick-up|N/C no bid $30.00 $75.00




